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Service Summary

Visitation
6:00 PM to 8:00 PM, Sun Jun 26, 2011

Resthaven Mortuary
310 North Hwy 65
Trenton, MO 64683

Funeral Service
11:00 AM Mon Jun 27, 2011

Resthaven Mortuary
310 North Hwy 65
Trenton, MO 64683

Obituary

Born: Thursday, June 15, 1967
Died: Thursday, June 23, 2011

Michelle Melody Kincade, a 44 year old resident of Gilman
City, MO passed away at 8:30 a.m., Thursday, June 23, 2011
due to an automobile accident.

Funeral services are scheduled for 11:00 a.m., Monday, June
27, 2011 at Resthaven Mortuary of Trenton, MO.  Burial will
be in the Edinburg I.O.O.F. Cemetery.  A visitation is
scheduled for 6 to 8 Sunday evening at the funeral
home.  Open visitation will begin Saturday after 1:00 p.m.

Michelle Kincade was born June 15, 1967 in Fargo, ND to
Donald and Patricia Wolf Bjuland.  She graduated from
Ruskin High School in Kansas City, MO and received a
degree in Physical Therapy from Rockhurst College and then
her doctorate from Creighton University.  Michelle worked
for over twenty years at Wright Memorial Hospital and was
currently working at Putnam County Hospital.  She attended
the Melbourne Baptist Church and a member of the North
Missouri Saddle Club.

Surviving relatives include her husband, Robert “Robbie”
Kincade and daughter, Sarah Higgins of the home; her
mother, Pat of Lee’s Summit, MO; her father, Donald
Bjuland and his wife, Arlene of Independence, MO; and a
brother, Christopher Bjuland and his wife, Elli of San
Francisco, CA.  

Memorial donations may be made to Sarah’s Scholarship
Fund, they can be left with the funeral home or mailed to
Resthaven Mortuary, P.O. Box 587, Trenton, MO  64683.
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